
BASE BID PROPOSAL 2023-2024

ITEM
ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY

TYPE OF PAPER CASE/REAM TYPE OF DELIVERY
Paper 

Corporation
Contract 

Paper Group
Clayton Paper Office Depot

8.5" X 11"
Multi-purpose

8.5" X 14"

Multi-purpose

White

11" X 17"

Multi-purpose

(2500 Sheets per carton)

8.5" X 11"

Multi-purpose

8.5" X 11"

Multi-purpose

8.5" X 14"

Multi-purpose

8.5" X 11"

Cardstock - 65#

8.5" X 11"

Cardstock - 65#

8.5" X 11"

Cardstock - 65#

 5-19 Pallets = 39.99 

 5-19 Pallets = 42.99  $                          38.15 

 $                          55.00 

 $                          36.75 

 $                          47.40 

 $                          37.90 

 $                          57.90 

 $                          37.80 

 $                          61.50 
 No Bid 

 $                          44.75 

 $                          49.00  $                          54.80 

 $                          44.00 
 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $                          56.92 

 $                          49.75 

 $                          55.85 

 78.44/ctn 

80

366

Colored - Pastel

ALTERNATE PRICE

DELIVERED PRICE

106

Colored - Bright

 $                          56.00 

DELIVERED PRICE

ALTERNATE PRICE

Colored - Pastel

 $                          56.25  53.94/ctn 

 $                          75.60 

ALTERNATE PRICE

DELIVERED PRICE

Vendors

 $                          45.30 

DELIVERED PRICE

ALTERNATE PRICE

171

700

White

25

DELIVERED PRICE

ALTERNATE PRICE

DELIVERED PRICE

ALTERNATE PRICE

DELIVERED PRICE

DELIVERED PRICEWhite

ALTERNATE PRICE
13110

ALTERNATE PRICE

DELIVERED PRICE

3
ALTERNATE PRICE

4

5

1

3

2

Colored - Bright

Colored - Pastel

9

8

7

6

White

0

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

CASE

REAM

REAM

REAM

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 68.22/ctn 

 $                          84.88  $                          80.40 


	PER CASE

